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Synopsis: "Radio Star" is a 1940's radio detective spoof. In The Case of the Long Distance Lover, Nick
McKitrick; Private Dick, is hired by femme fatale Fanny LaRue to find her husband's killer. The plot is a
standard mystery, but Radio Star's contemporary sense of humor sets it apart from the pack. A laugh out loud
radio romp, easily produced with one actress or a larger cast.

Cast Size: 1 Female

"Fu**ing brilliant" - Michael Musto

"Clever, original, and unflinchingly funny."- Broadway World

"Entertaining, vulgar, and truly hilarious."- Flavorpill

"Sharp, fearless writing, resulting in a candid, eye-catching performance."- New Theatre Corps

"Side-splittingly hilarious... the best one-woman show I've seen."- Edinburgh Three Weeks

"Satisfyingly funny and nostalgic."- Stage Directions Magazine
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From reader reviews:

Fern Rodriquez:

The ability that you get from Radio Star could be the more deep you excavating the information that hide in
the words the more you get serious about reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to know but
Radio Star giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in selected way that can
be understood by means of anyone who read the idea because the author of this book is well-known enough.
This kind of book also makes your own personal vocabulary increase well. Therefore it is easy to understand
then can go to you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We highly recommend you for having this
Radio Star instantly.

Melissa Sanders:

The actual book Radio Star will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading some sort of book. The
author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. In case you try to find new book to study, this book very
acceptable to you. The book Radio Star is much recommended to you you just read. You can also get the e-
book from the official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Maria Lamotte:

Reading a book being new life style in this season; every people loves to study a book. When you examine a
book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if
you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, in addition
to soon. The Radio Star provide you with a new experience in studying a book.

Kendrick Hardee:

As a student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or
make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's soul or real their
interest. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to generally there but nothing
reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
images on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we know that on
this era, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this Radio Star can make you sense more interested to read.
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