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Racism. Is it alive and well and living on college campuses across the United States? Is it a factor in high
dropout rates and other crises affecting minority college students, and if so, how? Are controversial programs
of affirmative action proving to be a solution--or are they part of the problem?

Here are some insights into the hot issues sparking debate over equal opportunity and American education.
In these pages, through the use of a fictional character, author Jay Rochlin presents more than forty very real
African American and Mexican American men and women who struggled to earn degrees at a large,
nationally recognized university in the west. Their goals, their gains, and their disappointments echo the
experiences of millions of others around the country during much of the twentieth century. Perhaps most
important, their true stories will provide inspiration to the many young people who wonder whether pursuing
the dream of a college education is possible for them.

Readers will warm to the words of Carlos Vélez-Ibáñez, learning as a toddler from his father that the
university represented toda la sabiduría del mundo,"all the wisdom in the world." Their hearts will go out to
young Laura Banks, barred as a black woman from a "whites only" pool and the swimming class required for
her degree in physical education. In the face of open hostility and closed doors, these students and many
others persevered. When they were shunned by Anglo social clubs, they created their own. When they were
assigned "back of the room" seating because of discrimination, they rose above it. And when their ultimate
goal--graduation--was threatened by racism, they fought it.

Looking back, many in the book remember coming from poor families who nonetheless considered
themselves middle class and, as such, simply expected their children to go to college. This family support--
bolstered by the students' own drive, ambition, and sense of responsibility--seemed to be pivotal to their
success. Thus the book comes out strongly on the side of critical race theorists, who emphasize individual
effort as a means of combating racism and personal narratives as a way of analyzing the complex issue.

These pages are filled with the voices of everyday men and women. Their language is straightforward and
from the heart. Their message is timely, in the midst of current debates over race, class, and affirmative
action. And their words--for American education and for the country as a whole--carry force and meaning
guaranteed to reach far into the future.
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From reader reviews:

Carolyn Livingston:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information today can get by anyone on everywhere.
The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be consider if those
information which is within the former life are challenging to be find than now could be taking seriously
which one is acceptable to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you have the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen with you if you take Race & Class on Campus: Conversations With
Ricardo's Daughter as the daily resource information.

Robert Rooks:

This book untitled Race & Class on Campus: Conversations With Ricardo's Daughter to be one of several
books that will best seller in this year, that's because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit in
it. You will easily to buy this specific book in the book retail store or you can order it by way of online. The
publisher on this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, because you can read this
book in your Smartphone. So there is no reason for you to past this reserve from your list.

Roger Borquez:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style with this era globalization. With reading through you can get
a lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world may share
their idea. Guides can also inspire a lot of people. A great deal of author can inspire their reader with their
story or even their experience. Not only the storyplot that share in the textbooks. But also they write about
the knowledge about something that you need example. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your young ones, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors on earth always try to
improve their skill in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them is
this Race & Class on Campus: Conversations With Ricardo's Daughter.

Andrew Taylor:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Race & Class on Campus:
Conversations With Ricardo's Daughter can be the answer, oh how comes? A book you know. You are and
so out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this fresh era is common not a nerd activity. So what
these guides have than the others?
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