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The streets are littered with the bodies of people who have tried and failed to make a living selling real
estate. Over 88% of new real estate agents leave the business within two years. Why is the failure rate so
tragically high? The answer lies in the number 1.7 million. There are 1.7 million agents chasing the same
buyers. There are 1.7 million agents chasing the same sellers. There are 1.7 million agents offering the same
exact services, the same exact way. They all look the same, sound the same, and think the same way. It's a
sad, sad, sea of sameness.

There aren't many ways to stand out in the world of real estate, but Alysse Musgrave has found one. It's a
world where clients are plentiful and grateful to be working with you. A world where driving buyers from
house to house, for months on end, is a thing of the past. A world where your income is stable, and your
nights and weekends are your own. Exclusive Buyer Agency has been around for years, but not the way
Alysse does it. Monkey See, Monkey Don't is written for anyone with a real estate license and even those
still contemplating a career in real estate sales. In her trademark straight to the point and brutally honest
style, Alysse teaches you the newest, sanest and most respectable path to success with your real estate
license, and condenses it to about 200 pages. It's a real estate career in a box. You'll learn:

The reason 88% of new agents are out of business within two years.●

How to sidestep the organizational and financial landmines that have been set for real estate agents.●

How to stand out in a vast sea of sameness.●

The proper way to represent and protect the rights of homebuyers, from your first meeting through closing.●

Why, in a fiercely competitive business, it's vitally important for you to "play nice with others" and to●

behave in a highly dignified manner.
 That generating leads is easy, if you offer a service that everyone wants.●

 The world of real estate is not immune from change brought on by advancements in technology. It's time to
embrace change and to be brave enough to ruffle a few feathers. Read with an open mind. Even if you decide
this business model isn't for you, you are guaranteed to learn many new ideas that you can use to foster the
growth of your existing business.
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From reader reviews:

Shannon Batiste:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be up-date about what going on or information even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era that is certainly always change and advance. Some of
you maybe may update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice in your case but the
problems coming to a person is you don't know which one you should start with. This Monkey See, Monkey
Don't: See Why 88% of Real Estate Agents Fail. Don't Be One of Them. is our recommendation so you keep
up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Harold Sparkman:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them loved ones
or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you would like try to find a new activity this is look different you can
read some sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent
the whole day to reading a publication. The book Monkey See, Monkey Don't: See Why 88% of Real Estate
Agents Fail. Don't Be One of Them. it doesn't matter what good to read. There are a lot of those who
recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space
to develop this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book out of your
smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book possesses high quality.

Marianne Haglund:

This Monkey See, Monkey Don't: See Why 88% of Real Estate Agents Fail. Don't Be One of Them. is brand
new way for you who has fascination to look for some information given it relief your hunger of knowledge.
Getting deeper you in it getting knowledge more you know otherwise you who still having small amount of
digest in reading this Monkey See, Monkey Don't: See Why 88% of Real Estate Agents Fail. Don't Be One
of Them. can be the light food for you because the information inside this book is easy to get by anyone.
These books build itself in the form that is certainly reachable by anyone, yep I mean in the e-book
application form. People who think that in book form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this reserve is the
answer. So you cannot find any in reading a e-book especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It
should be here for anyone. So , don't miss this! Just read this e-book type for your better life along with
knowledge.

Rhonda Rudder:

As a pupil exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library in order to
make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart or real their
leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to right now there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and also can't see colorful



photographs on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that
on this period of time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this Monkey See, Monkey Don't: See Why 88% of Real Estate Agents Fail. Don't Be
One of Them. can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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