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Two Voices is a collection of illustrated haibun by John Irvine and Maureen Irvine. According to John
Irvine, "Two Voices began as an idea after a complaint from my poet/writer wife (justified!) that although I
had, and still was, building anthology after anthology I had never suggested a joint collection with her." John
took her comments to heart and thought long and hard about what we might do. A few years before, John
and Maureen had both fallen in love with the various Japanese styles of poetry and had both written many
haiku and senryu. John then discovered haiga and embraced that particular type with its haiku written on a
photograph or other illustration. It seemed that the ideal form for the poets and writers was the haibun. In this
particular type of poem prose is interspersed with haiku/senryu. Unfortunately, pressure of work (more
anthologies) sidelined the collection for a couple of years but finally, with the expert help of my genius
graphics friend, Dave Freeman, and the interest shown by Roger Lang of Pohutukawa Publishing in NZ, here
it is!
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From reader reviews:

Rose Waldman:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? Publication is very important
thing for us to learn everything in the world. Each book has different aim or perhaps goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. They can be
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby is definitely reading a book. Consider the person who
don't like examining a book? Sometime, man feel need book once they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you will want this Two Voices: Collected from Maureen and John Irvine.

Larry Young:

The book Two Voices: Collected from Maureen and John Irvine can give more knowledge and information
about everything you want. Why must we leave a good thing like a book Two Voices: Collected from
Maureen and John Irvine? Several of you have a different opinion about book. But one aim that book can
give many information for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book.
Knowledge or info that you take for that, you may give for each other; you are able to share all of these.
Book Two Voices: Collected from Maureen and John Irvine has simple shape but you know: it has great and
massive function for you. You can seem the enormous world by open up and read a book. So it is very
wonderful.

Amy Davis:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't evaluate book by its cover may doesn't
work here is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside seem
likes. Maybe you answer might be Two Voices: Collected from Maureen and John Irvine why because the
amazing cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or
content will be fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick
up this book.

Jacob Lehr:

Within this era which is the greater person or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you have
to do is just spending your time very little but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of several
books in the top list in your reading list is usually Two Voices: Collected from Maureen and John Irvine.
This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in turning out to be precious
person. By looking up and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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