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Chained to the Rock of Adversity offers valuable insight into the lives of the Old South's free women of
color, using personal letters and a diary to tell an extraordinary story.

The letters, from family members and friends, were written between 1844 and 1899 to Ann Battles Johnson,
wife of prominent Natchez businessman William T. Johnson, and her daughter Anna, while Ann's daughter
Catharine wrote the diary. A freed slave herself, Ann Johnson became the head of her family and a
slaveholder before the Civil War. Her days were filled with the often tedious and sometimes overwhelming
duties assigned to slaveholding women, but her race separated her from most other women of this class. The
writings depict a tight-knit network of family and friends and show a family well aware of its precarious
position in society, feared by most whites and resented by other blacks.

Editor Virginia Meacham Gould provides an extensive introduction, a cast of characters, identifying notes,
and a brief afterword tracing the Johnson family to the present day.
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From reader reviews:

Martin Phair:

What do you think about book? It is just for students as they are still students or the idea for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that concern above. Every person
has diverse personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't
need do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Chained to the Rock of Adversity:
To Be Free, Black, and Female in the Old South (Southern Voices from the Past: Women's Letters, Diaries,
and Writings Ser.). All type of book is it possible to see on many options. You can look for the internet
resources or other social media.

Sharon Doyle:

The actual book Chained to the Rock of Adversity: To Be Free, Black, and Female in the Old South
(Southern Voices from the Past: Women's Letters, Diaries, and Writings Ser.) has a lot of information on it.
So when you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very
famous author. Tom makes some research previous to write this book. This particular book very easy to read
you may get the point easily after reading this book.

Julie Gooch:

This Chained to the Rock of Adversity: To Be Free, Black, and Female in the Old South (Southern Voices
from the Past: Women's Letters, Diaries, and Writings Ser.) is new way for you who has fascination to look
for some information mainly because it relief your hunger of knowledge. Getting deeper you upon it getting
knowledge more you know or else you who still having tiny amount of digest in reading this Chained to the
Rock of Adversity: To Be Free, Black, and Female in the Old South (Southern Voices from the Past:
Women's Letters, Diaries, and Writings Ser.) can be the light food for you because the information inside
this kind of book is easy to get by simply anyone. These books build itself in the form which is reachable by
anyone, sure I mean in the e-book web form. People who think that in reserve form make them feel sleepy
even dizzy this publication is the answer. So there is no in reading a publication especially this one. You can
find what you are looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book
variety for your better life along with knowledge.

Stephen Redmond:

You will get this Chained to the Rock of Adversity: To Be Free, Black, and Female in the Old South
(Southern Voices from the Past: Women's Letters, Diaries, and Writings Ser.) by look at the bookstore or
Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve issue if you get difficulties for the knowledge.
Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by simply written or printed but also can you enjoy this book
through e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking by your mobile phone and searching what
their problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your publication. It is most



important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose right ways for you.
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