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Velara is to wed Rahn, a knight from a neighboring kingdom, in order to provide her father, King Nolan, a
male heir for their kingdom. Haidyn, a dragon, has been sent to King Nolan in order to create a new treaty to
bring further peace to his kind. When Rahn reveals his own intentions for Velara and the throne though, it
will be up to the dragon to protect the princess and the kingdom from the knight.
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From reader reviews:

John Lyons:

Inside other case, little men and women like to read book Not Your Average Fairy Tale. You can choose the
best book if you want reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a book Not Your Average
Fairy Tale. You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely
right, due to the fact from book you can learn everything! From your country until finally foreign or abroad
you will find yourself known. About simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we
can easily open a book as well as searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You should use it when
you feel bored to go to the library. Let's read.

Allison Phelps:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the subject Not Your
Average Fairy Tale suitable to you? Typically the book was written by popular writer in this era. The
particular book untitled Not Your Average Fairy Taleis a single of several books that will everyone read
now. This particular book was inspired lots of people in the world. When you read this book you will enter
the new dimension that you ever know prior to. The author explained their thought in the simple way, thus
all of people can easily to be aware of the core of this reserve. This book will give you a great deal of
information about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world with this book.

Ella Woods:

The book Not Your Average Fairy Tale has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can get a
lot of help. The book was written by the very famous author. The writer makes some research just before
write this book. This particular book very easy to read you may get the point easily after looking over this
book.

Maria Levine:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book compared to can
satisfy your short time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find reserve that need more
time to be learn. Not Your Average Fairy Tale can be your answer mainly because it can be read by anyone
who have those short free time problems.
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