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The "Gothic" style was a key trend in Italian cinema of the 1950s and 1960s because of its peculiar, often
strikingly original approach to the horror genre. These films portrayed Gothic staples in a stylish and
idiosyncratic way, and took a daring approach to the supernatural and to eroticism, with the presence of
menacing yet seductive female witches, vampires and ghosts. Thanks to such filmmakers as Mario Bava
(Black Sunday), Riccardo Freda (The Horrible Dr. Hichcock), and Antonio Margheriti (Castle of Blood), as
well the iconic presence of actress Barbara Steele, Italian Gothic horror went overseas and reached cult
status. The book examines the Italian Gothic horror of the period, with an abundance of previously
unpublished production information drawn from official papers and original scripts. Entries include a
complete cast and crew list, home video releases, plot summary and the author's analysis. Excerpts from
interviews with filmmakers, scriptwriters and actors are included. The foreword is by film director and
scriptwriter Ernesto Gastaldi.
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From reader reviews:

Frankie Graybill:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children till adult are different content. We all know that that
book is very important for people. The book Italian Gothic Horror Films, 1957-1969 ended up being making
you to know about other knowledge and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages
for you. The book Italian Gothic Horror Films, 1957-1969 is not only giving you more new information but
also being your friend when you sense bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your guide.
Try to make relationship using the book Italian Gothic Horror Films, 1957-1969. You never experience lose
out for everything if you read some books.

Gayle Oconnell:

Do you considered one of people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold
on guys this particular aren't like that. This Italian Gothic Horror Films, 1957-1969 book is readable simply
by you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable reading
experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to provide to you. The writer
connected with Italian Gothic Horror Films, 1957-1969 content conveys the thought easily to understand by
lots of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just different available as it. So ,
do you even now thinking Italian Gothic Horror Films, 1957-1969 is not loveable to be your top checklist
reading book?

Joshua Yoshida:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a reserve we can know
everything we want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every year has
been exactly added. This reserve Italian Gothic Horror Films, 1957-1969 was filled concerning science.
Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has several feel
when they reading a book. If you know how big good thing about a book, you can truly feel enjoy to read a
e-book. In the modern era like right now, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Pearlie Wong:

Reserve is one of source of knowledge. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen need book to know the upgrade information of year to year. As we know those textbooks
have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can bring us to around the world. By the book
Italian Gothic Horror Films, 1957-1969 we can take more advantage. Don't you to be creative people? To
become creative person must love to read a book. Just simply choose the best book that appropriate with
your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life at this time book Italian Gothic Horror Films, 1957-
1969. You can more inviting than now.
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