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Do you need to refocus on what's important for the road ahead? Refocused will help you remember who God
is, who you are, and what he's called you to focus on in this season. This illustrated, coloring book bible
study takes you on a visionary journey through scripture to remind you of your treasured identity in Christ
and the good plans he has for you to fulfill during this season of your life. It's perfect for women of all ages!
Each day of this short, six day study has a scripture reading, reflective questions, visionary planning with
purpose, and a prayer prompt to to engage you in as you color an illustration that brings the scripture to life.
It ends with an inspiring planning exercise to set goals for the year ahead with passion and purpose! It
includes group discussion questions, and more resources can be found at RefocusedBibleStudy.com
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From reader reviews:

Kevin Nixon:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the guide entitled Refocused: Fixing your eyes on Jesus for the road ahead: single
woman edition. Try to face the book Refocused: Fixing your eyes on Jesus for the road ahead: single woman
edition as your close friend. It means that it can to be your friend when you experience alone and beside
associated with course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you
far more confidence because you can know everything by the book. So , we need to make new experience
and knowledge with this book.

Louis Watson:

What do you consider book? It is just for students because they are still students or the item for all people in
the world, exactly what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that query above. Every
person has distinct personality and hobby for each other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they
don't desire do that. You must know how great along with important the book Refocused: Fixing your eyes
on Jesus for the road ahead: single woman edition. All type of book can you see on many sources. You can
look for the internet methods or other social media.

Sandra McNulty:

This Refocused: Fixing your eyes on Jesus for the road ahead: single woman edition is brand-new way for
you who has fascination to look for some information mainly because it relief your hunger associated with.
Getting deeper you into it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having little digest in reading
this Refocused: Fixing your eyes on Jesus for the road ahead: single woman edition can be the light food in
your case because the information inside this book is easy to get by means of anyone. These books create
itself in the form and that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book type. People who think that in
publication form make them feel tired even dizzy this guide is the answer. So there isn't any in reading a e-
book especially this one. You can find what you are looking for. It should be here for you. So , don't miss the
item! Just read this e-book variety for your better life in addition to knowledge.

Barbara Simon:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you might
have it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This Refocused: Fixing your eyes on Jesus for the road
ahead: single woman edition can give you a lot of pals because by you looking at this one book you have
issue that they don't and make anyone more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a
step for you to get success. This guide offer you information that possibly your friend doesn't realize, by
knowing more than different make you to be great people. So , why hesitate? Let us have Refocused: Fixing



your eyes on Jesus for the road ahead: single woman edition.
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