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Wiki Loves Monuments is an international photo contest for monuments, organized by Wikimedia in
September. Wikimedia is the movement behind Wikipedia, the free encyclopedia - a global collaboration
authored by volunteers. Calvendo calendars are premium products - a bit more pricey than others but with
added benefits: Our calendars always look beautiful on your wall because we produce them locally with
premium paper and sophisticated spiral binding, ensuring easy turning of pages and flat hanging against the
wall. A protective transparent plastic cover sheet provides added stability and each calendar comes in five
languages. Treat yourself to a Calvendo calendar and you get something that looks better all year round.
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From reader reviews:

Katie Martinez:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? That's why,
you can choose the suitable activity intended for spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare
time to take a move, shopping, or went to the actual Mall. How about open or even read a book called
Monuments of Lebanon 2015: The Best Photos from Wiki Loves Monuments, the World's Largest Photo
Competition on Wikipedia (Calvendo Places)? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You understand
beside you can spend your time using your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with
their opinion or you have additional opinion?

Rosemarie Cleveland:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
info. When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of various ways to
share the information or even their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you actually more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially hype book the author will bring someone to imagine the story
how the figures do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read this
Monuments of Lebanon 2015: The Best Photos from Wiki Loves Monuments, the World's Largest Photo
Competition on Wikipedia (Calvendo Places), you are able to tells your family, friends in addition to soon
about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a guide.

Dianne Tripp:

Beside this specific Monuments of Lebanon 2015: The Best Photos from Wiki Loves Monuments, the
World's Largest Photo Competition on Wikipedia (Calvendo Places) in your phone, it may give you a way to
get closer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh from
your oven so don't possibly be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow commune. It is good
thing to have Monuments of Lebanon 2015: The Best Photos from Wiki Loves Monuments, the World's
Largest Photo Competition on Wikipedia (Calvendo Places) because this book offers to you readable
information. Do you sometimes have book but you rarely get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that won't
happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, like treasuring
beautiful island. Use you still want to miss this? Find this book as well as read it from now!

George Hughes:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book can filled the space in your house, you may have it in e-
book approach, more simple and reachable. This kind of Monuments of Lebanon 2015: The Best Photos
from Wiki Loves Monuments, the World's Largest Photo Competition on Wikipedia (Calvendo Places) can



give you a lot of close friends because by you investigating this one book you have matter that they don't and
make anyone more like an interesting person. This book can be one of one step for you to get success. This
guide offer you information that perhaps your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than other make
you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? We need to have Monuments of Lebanon 2015: The Best Photos
from Wiki Loves Monuments, the World's Largest Photo Competition on Wikipedia (Calvendo Places).
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