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Born in Nicaragua, Rubén Darío is known as the consummate leader of the Modernista movement, an
esthetic trend that swept the Americas from Mexico to Argentina at the end of the nineteenth century.
Seeking a language and a style that would distinguish the newly emergent nations from the old imperial
power of Spain, Darío’s writing offered a refreshingly new vision of the world—an artistic sensibility at once
cosmopolitan and connected to the rhythms of nature. The first part of this collection presents Darío’s most
significant poems in a bilingual format and organized thematically in the way Darío himself envisioned
them. The second part is devoted to Darío’s prose, including short stories, fables, profiles, travel writing,
reportage, opinion pieces, and letters. A sweeping biographical introduction by distinguished critic Ilan
Stavans places Darío in historical and artistic context, not only in Latin America but in world literature.

For more than seventy years, Penguin has been the leading publisher of classic literature in the English-
speaking world. With more than 1,700 titles, Penguin Classics represents a global bookshelf of the best
works throughout history and across genres and disciplines. Readers trust the series to provide authoritative
texts enhanced by introductions and notes by distinguished scholars and contemporary authors, as well as
up-to-date translations by award-winning translators.
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From reader reviews:

Chris Bynum:

Here thing why this specific Selected Writings (Penguin Classics) are different and trusted to be yours. First
of all reading through a book is good but it depends in the content of it which is the content is as delicious as
food or not. Selected Writings (Penguin Classics) giving you information deeper and different ways, you can
find any guide out there but there is no reserve that similar with Selected Writings (Penguin Classics). It
gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your current eyes about the thing this happened in the world
which is probably can be happened around you. It is possible to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even
in your technique home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the
form of Selected Writings (Penguin Classics) in e-book can be your substitute.

Daniel Miller:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a reserve you will get new information simply because book is one of several ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you studying a book especially fiction book the author will bring one to imagine the story
how the figures do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to other people. When you read
this Selected Writings (Penguin Classics), it is possible to tells your family, friends and also soon about
yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a reserve.

Ruth Williams:

Selected Writings (Penguin Classics) can be one of your starter books that are good idea. All of us
recommend that straight away because this publication has good vocabulary which could increase your
knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining however delivering the information. The copy
writer giving his/her effort to put every word into satisfaction arrangement in writing Selected Writings
(Penguin Classics) however doesn't forget the main level, giving the reader the hottest and based confirm
resource info that maybe you can be considered one of it. This great information may drawn you into new
stage of crucial pondering.

Lionel Huggins:

A number of people said that they feel uninterested when they reading a book. They are directly felt it when
they get a half regions of the book. You can choose the actual book Selected Writings (Penguin Classics) to
make your own reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading talent is developing when you just like
reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy you just read it and mingle the feeling about
book and looking at especially. It is to be initially opinion for you to like to available a book and learn it.
Beside that the guide Selected Writings (Penguin Classics) can to be a newly purchased friend when you're
really feel alone and confuse in what must you're doing of their time.
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