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What if a naval captain went rogue with an American battleship?

In October, 1812, as the 32-gun U.S. frigate Essex ventured out against the British enemy, only one man had
any idea that this cruise would turn into the longest, strangest naval adventure in American history. That man
was Captain David Porter, who had decided to run off with the navy's ship and its three hundred men to fight
a separate Pacific war--one of privateering, pillaging, and orgies. Drawing on Porter's own writings and the
accounts of eyewitnesses, the author memorably recounts the events of a dark and fatal voyage in which
David Porter crosses the line from commander to cult-leader, from improbable fantasy to disastrous reality.

In a tale so amazing that it reads like fiction, Porter, impelled by his own demons and by rivalry with the
ghostly British buccaneer Lord Anson, took his men and boys on a seventeen-month mystery tour that did
not end until he had disrupted the Chilean revolution, captured the entire English whaling fleet (manned
mainly by Americans), vanished into the enchanted Galapagos, and re-emerged in Polynesia, where he made
himself the conqueror-chief of the stone-age Nukuhivans. In the end, when he sought redemption with a
glorious victory over a British opponent, he failed terribly and sacrificed the lives of one-third of his crew to
his personal notions of heroism.

Robert Booth tells the story of the ill-fated Essex with accuracy, immediacy, and a broad vision of its
meanings as an epic of war, a gripping tale of the sea, a brilliant portrait of a disturbed and disturbing
American hero, and a geo-political thriller that sheds new light on the origins of U.S. imperialism, the
tragedy of missed opportunities, and the disastrous and permanent impact of Porter's rampage on the peoples
of the Pacific.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Floyd:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
consequently. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a e-book you will get new information simply because book is one of many
ways to share the information or their idea. Second, reading through a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you looking at a book especially fictional book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the characters do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you
read this Mad For Glory: A Heart of Darkness in the War of 1812, you may tells your family, friends along
with soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a book.

Earl Hess:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you never know the inside because don't assess book by its include may
doesn't work this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer might be Mad For Glory: A Heart of Darkness in the War of 1812
why because the fantastic cover that make you consider in regards to the content will not disappoint an
individual. The inside or content is actually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading 6th sense
will directly assist you to pick up this book.

Roy Hanson:

Many people spending their time period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity together with
family or just watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to invest your whole day by looking at a
book. Ugh, do you consider reading a book can definitely hard because you have to bring the book
everywhere? It ok you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Mad For
Glory: A Heart of Darkness in the War of 1812 which is obtaining the e-book version. So , try out this book?
Let's notice.

Michael Velez:

As a student exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart or
real their pastime. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to there but
nothing reading really. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring and can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important for you personally. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. So , this Mad For Glory: A Heart of Darkness in the War of 1812 can make you really
feel more interested to read.
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