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For the artist Carlos Rolon (born 1970), aka Dzine, boxing loomed large in his childhood household; he
recalls watching a young Howard Cosell on ABC’s Wide World and the infamous No Mas fight with Roberto
Duran and Sugar Ray Leonard--occasions that also provided opportunities to bond with his father. On the
heels of Dzine’s previous publication Nailed, Boxed looks at how artists have used boxing as a metaphor or
have been otherwise inspired by the sport. Alongside new work from Dzine, it includes art by Andreas
Gursky, Jean-Michel Basquiat, Andy Warhol, Gary Simmons, Satch Hoyt, Rashid Johnson, Christopher
Wool, Cheryl Dunn, David Hammons, Ed Ruscha, Jeff Koons, George Bellows, Yoshitomo Nara, Jules De
Balincourt, Paul Pfeiffer, Claes Oldenburg, Glenn Ligon, Lyle Owerko, Chris Mosier and Ed Paschke,
among others.
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From reader reviews:

Matt Cresswell:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be change about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make all of them keep up with the era and that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe
will update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know what one you should start with. This Boxed: A Visual History and the Art of
Boxing is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you
want and want in this era.

James Shipp:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try to and must have the free time or they will get wide
range of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are
you experiencing when the spare time coming to a person of course your answer will certainly unlimited
right. Then do you try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative within spending your spare
time, often the book you have read is usually Boxed: A Visual History and the Art of Boxing.

Guadalupe Hauser:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the water world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try point that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not sensation tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you already been ride on and with addition info. Even you love Boxed: A Visual History and
the Art of Boxing, you can enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its referred to
as reading friends.

Wanda Collins:

As we know that book is vital thing to add our information for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we wish. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year had been
exactly added. This publication Boxed: A Visual History and the Art of Boxing was filled concerning
science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your technology competence. Some people has
distinct feel when they reading any book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can truly feel enjoy
to read a e-book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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