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"A pulse-pounding thriller with a charming protagonist" (Kirkus Reviews).

Jack Bertolino’s son, Chris, was the victim of a brutal murder attempt and Vincent Cardona, a mafia boss,
provided information that helped Jack take down the perpetrator of the crime. Jack accepted the favor
knowing there’d be blowback. In Blond Cargo, the mobster’s daughter has gone missing and Cardona turned
in his chit. Jack discovers that the young, blond, mafia princess has been kidnapped and imprisoned while
rich, politically connected men negotiate her value as a sex slave.

A sizzling whodunit for fans of James Patterson and Patricia Cornwell, Blond Cargo taps into the real-life
crime world to deliver a thrilling, action-packed story that will keep you on the edge of your seat until the
explosive, unprecedented finale.

"An unyielding pace, vigorous characters and explosive ending." —Kirkus Reviews

“A fantastic read…This extremely fast and well-thought-out thriller will remind some of James Patterson’s
early works. The action is great right up to the end and, luckily, Jack Bertolino will be staying on the fiction
scene to continue his search for any and all bad guys to come.” —Suspense Magazine
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From reader reviews:

Jennifer Darby:

The book Blond Cargo (The Jack Bertolino Series) can give more knowledge and also the precise product
information about everything you want. So why must we leave a good thing like a book Blond Cargo (The
Jack Bertolino Series)? Several of you have a different opinion about guide. But one aim that will book can
give many facts for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or facts
that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you could share all of these. Book Blond Cargo
(The Jack Bertolino Series) has simple shape nevertheless, you know: it has great and massive function for
you. You can seem the enormous world by start and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Vivian Nava:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive at this
point, people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated that for a
while is reading. Yeah, by reading a book your ability to survive increase then having chance to remain than
other is high. In your case who want to start reading a book, we give you this kind of Blond Cargo (The Jack
Bertolino Series) book as basic and daily reading publication. Why, because this book is more than just a
book.

Delbert Storey:

The book untitled Blond Cargo (The Jack Bertolino Series) contain a lot of information on the item. The
writer explains your ex idea with easy approach. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do
not really worry, you can easy to read this. The book was written by famous author. The author will take you
in the new time of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can please read on your smart
phone, or program, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you
can available their official web-site and order it. Have a nice read.

Richard Moultrie:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a group of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This book Blond Cargo (The Jack Bertolino Series) was filled regarding science. Spend
your time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has different feel when they
reading a book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can sense enjoy to read a publication. In the
modern era like today, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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