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A friendly and accessible introduction to the most useful algorithms

Computer algorithms are the basic recipes for programming. Professional programmers need to know how to
use algorithms to solve difficult programming problems. Written in simple, intuitive English, this book
describes how and when to use the most practical classic algorithms, and even how to create new algorithms
to meet future needs. The book also includes a collection of questions that can help readers prepare for a
programming job interview.

Reveals methods for manipulating common data structures such as arrays, linked lists, trees, and networks●

Addresses advanced data structures such as heaps, 2-3 trees, B-trees●

Addresses general problem-solving techniques such as branch and bound, divide and conquer, recursion,●

backtracking, heuristics, and more
Reviews sorting and searching, network algorithms, and numerical algorithms●

Includes general problem-solving techniques such as brute force and exhaustive search, divide and●

conquer, backtracking, recursion, branch and bound, and more

In addition, Essential Algorithms features a companion website that includes full instructor materials to
support training or higher ed adoptions.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Martinez:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like
looking for your favorite guide and reading a guide. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can
add your knowledge by the guide entitled Essential Algorithms: A Practical Approach to Computer
Algorithms. Try to make the book Essential Algorithms: A Practical Approach to Computer Algorithms as
your pal. It means that it can for being your friend when you experience alone and beside that of course make
you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you a lot more confidence
because you can know every thing by the book. So , we need to make new experience and also knowledge
with this book.

Aurelio Ashley:

What do you regarding book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you require something
to explain what yours problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man? If you don't have spare
time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time? What did you do?
Every individual has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question mainly because just their
can do in which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is proper. Because start
from on guardería until university need this Essential Algorithms: A Practical Approach to Computer
Algorithms to read.

William Duhon:

This book untitled Essential Algorithms: A Practical Approach to Computer Algorithms to be one of several
books that will best seller in this year, here is because when you read this book you can get a lot of benefit in
it. You will easily to buy this kind of book in the book retailer or you can order it by using online. The
publisher of the book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this book, as you can read this book
in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this reserve from your list.

Bernice Martinez:

The book untitled Essential Algorithms: A Practical Approach to Computer Algorithms contain a lot of
information on that. The writer explains the woman idea with easy way. The language is very easy to
understand all the people, so do certainly not worry, you can easy to read that. The book was published by
famous author. The author provides you in the new period of literary works. It is easy to read this book
because you can please read on your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book with anywhere and
anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a
nice go through.
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