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There are precisely two further generalizations of the real and complex numbers, namely, the quaternions
and the octonions. The quaternions naturally describe rotations in three dimensions. In fact, all (continuous)
symmetry groups are based on one of these four number systems. This book provides an elementary
introduction to the properties of the octonions, with emphasis on their geometric structure. Elementary
applications covered include the rotation groups and their spacetime generalization, the Lorentz group, as
well as the eigenvalue problem for Hermitian matrices. In addition, more sophisticated applications include
the exceptional Lie groups, octonionic projective spaces, and applications to particle physics including the
remarkable fact that classical supersymmetry only exists in particular spacetime dimensions.<><>
Readership: Advanced undergraduate and graduate students and faculty in mathematics and physics; non-
experts with moderately sophisticated mathematics background.
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From reader reviews:

Amy Sims:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a concern. What people must be
consider if those information which is from the former life are hard to be find than now is taking seriously
which one would work to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take The Geometry of the Octonions as your daily
resource information.

Dennis Byrd:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to learn? May be the book with the title The Geometry of
the Octonions suitable to you? Typically the book was written by well known writer in this era. The book
untitled The Geometry of the Octonionsis a single of several books that will everyone read now. This
particular book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter
the new dimensions that you ever know before. The author explained their idea in the simple way, so all of
people can easily to understand the core of this guide. This book will give you a lot of information about this
world now. In order to see the represented of the world on this book.

April Robles:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book than
can satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need more time to
be study. The Geometry of the Octonions can be your answer as it can be read by a person who have those
short free time problems.

Kimberly Gomez:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen need book to know the upgrade information of year to help year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around the world.
By the book The Geometry of the Octonions we can get more advantage. Don't that you be creative people?
To be creative person must choose to read a book. Only choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't
be doubt to change your life at this book The Geometry of the Octonions. You can more appealing than now.
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