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Mary DiNunzio is a trademark Lisa Scottoline heroine—she's strong, she's smart, and she's got plenty of
attitude. In recent years, she's become a big-time business-getter at Rosato & Associates, but the last person
she expects to walk into her office one morning—in mile-high stilettos—is super sexy Trish Gambone, her
high school rival. Back then, while Mary was becoming the straight-A president of the Latin Club and Most
Likely to Achieve Sainthood, Trish was the head Mean Girl, who flunked religion and excelled at smoking in
the bathroom.

As it turns out, however, Trish's life has taken a horrifying turn. She's terrified of her live-in boyfriend, who's
an abusive, gun-toting drug dealer for the South Philly mob. There's only one problem—Mary remembers
the guy from high school too. Unbeknownst to Trish, Mary had a major crush on him.

Then Trish vanishes, a dead body turns up in an alley, and Mary is plunged into a nightmare, one that
threatens her job, her family, and even her life. She goes on a one-woman crusade to unmask the killer, and
on the way, finds new love in a very unexpected place. But before the novel's shocking surprise ending,
Mary is forced to confront some very uncomfortable truths about her own past, and the profound effects of
lifelong love—and hate.
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From reader reviews:

William Smith:

The book with title Lady Killer posesses a lot of information that you can find out it. You can get a lot of
advantage after read this book. This book exist new knowledge the information that exist in this book
represented the condition of the world now. That is important to yo7u to know how the improvement of the
world. This specific book will bring you in new era of the glowbal growth. You can read the e-book in your
smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Donald Chapin:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always aim to and must have the time or they will get wide range
of stress from both day to day life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not only a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity do you have
when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try this one,
reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, the book you have read is usually
Lady Killer.

Herman Pendergrass:

This Lady Killer is great e-book for you because the content which can be full of information for you who
have always deal with world and possess to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal it facts
accurately using great arrange word or we can declare no rambling sentences in it. So if you are read this
hurriedly you can have whole data in it. Doesn't mean it only gives you straight forward sentences but tricky
core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Lady Killer in your hand like finding the world
in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no reserve that offer you world within
ten or fifteen minute right but this publication already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hey
there Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt which?

Milan Allen:

A lot of book has printed but it is different. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the most
effective book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is known as of
book Lady Killer. You can include your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it might add
your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware about reserve. It
can bring you from one spot to other place.
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