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A concise history of perhaps the most decisive campaign of the Peninsula War. The author's stated intention
is to establish a broad framework of the 1812 campaign in Spain so that students of military history can draw
from it 'lessons which may be useful in the future'. He argues that the Salamanca campaign was particularly
interesting because the two sides were evenly matched. Marindin sets the scene with a brief account of
Wellington's storming of Ciudad Roderigo and Badajoz and his eventual advance on Salamanca. He then
recounts the duel between Wellington and Marshals Soult and Marmont for the Salamanca forts; and the
preliminary moves be both sides before the battle itself on July 22nd. The book concludes with a discussion
of the lessons to be learned from the battle, and there are appendices on Wellington's orders to his troops
after the battle, the French order of battle, and writings on the engagement by other authorities: Napier,
Alison, Marmont and Thiers. The book is well illustrated by detailed maps.
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From reader reviews:

Doreen Harry:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the name SALAMANCA
CAMPAIGN 1812 suitable to you? The book was written by famous writer in this era. Often the book
untitled SALAMANCA CAMPAIGN 1812is the main of several books which everyone read now. This kind
of book was inspired a lot of people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new
dimensions that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their thought in the simple way, and so all of
people can easily to recognise the core of this reserve. This book will give you a great deal of information
about this world now. So you can see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Norma Eberhart:

Do you have something that you enjoy such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to choose book
like comic, quick story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not seeking SALAMANCA
CAMPAIGN 1812 that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading
addiction all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world better then how they
react toward the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading habit only for the geeky man but for all of
you who wants to become success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading through as your good
habit, you are able to pick SALAMANCA CAMPAIGN 1812 become your personal starter.

Maria Couch:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book
that need more time to be examine. SALAMANCA CAMPAIGN 1812 can be your answer given it can be
read by a person who have those short free time problems.

John Johnson:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our knowledge for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we would like. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated as well as blank sheet. Every year
ended up being exactly added. This reserve SALAMANCA CAMPAIGN 1812 was filled about science.
Spend your free time to add your knowledge about your research competence. Some people has diverse feel
when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a
book. In the modern era like today, many ways to get book that you just wanted.
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