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The articles in this collection focus on the intersection of competition law and class actions. They consider
the role that class actions can play in achieving an optimally competitive market for goods and services and
in providing compensation for those who have suffered as a result of anticompetitive conduct. They examine
key issues such as the appropriate test for class action certification and acceptable methodologies for
calculating damages, and in doing so, they bring to bear the views of legal academics, economists, and
experienced practising lawyers.

This book grew out of a symposium held at the Faculty of Law at the University of Western Ontario in late
March 2005. The symposium brought together Canadian academics working in either the competition or
class action field, practitioners involved in competition class action cases, judges who had heard some of
these cases, and American academics who contributed a valuable comparative law perspective. The speakers
each contributed an article to this collection, as did many of the commentators.
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From reader reviews:

Karen Moore:

The book Litigating Conspiracy: An Analysis of Competition Class Actions can give more knowledge and
also the precise product information about everything you want. Why then must we leave a good thing like a
book Litigating Conspiracy: An Analysis of Competition Class Actions? Several of you have a different
opinion about book. But one aim this book can give many information for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right
now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, you are able to give for each
other; you could share all of these. Book Litigating Conspiracy: An Analysis of Competition Class Actions
has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and massive function for you. You can look the enormous
world by available and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Lanell Sessions:

As people who live in the modest era should be revise about what going on or data even knowledge to make
these people keep up with the era and that is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you personally but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know which you should start with. This Litigating Conspiracy:
An Analysis of Competition Class Actions is our recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why,
since this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Joe Dix:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the subject Litigating
Conspiracy: An Analysis of Competition Class Actions suitable to you? Often the book was written by
popular writer in this era. Often the book untitled Litigating Conspiracy: An Analysis of Competition Class
Actionsis the main of several books that will everyone read now. This specific book was inspired lots of
people in the world. When you read this e-book you will enter the new shape that you ever know prior to.
The author explained their strategy in the simple way, thus all of people can easily to know the core of this e-
book. This book will give you a lot of information about this world now. So you can see the represented of
the world in this particular book.

Patricia Miller:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you actually, why because this Litigating Conspiracy: An Analysis
of Competition Class Actions publication written by well-known writer who knows well how to make book
that can be understand by anyone who read the book. Written in good manner for you, leaking every ideas
and writing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt Litigating Conspiracy: An Analysis
of Competition Class Actions as good book not merely by the cover but also with the content. This is one
book that can break don't assess book by its deal with, so do you still needing an additional sixth sense to
pick this!? Oh come on your looking at sixth sense already said so why you have to listening to another sixth
sense.
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