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These days it seems obvious that stupendous constructions like St Pancras Station should be preserved and
restored. But as recently as the 1970s Glasgow’s superb St Enoch’s Hotel made way for a shopping centre,
and in the 1960s St Pancras itself was also earmarked for demolition. “Victorian” was a term of abuse. Add
in wartime bombing by the Luftwaffe, and town planners eager for ring roads and multi-storeys, and the
destruction is shocking. This poignant, angry book, full of stunning images, chronicles the catastrophic
swathe cut through Britain’s architectural heritage by the twentieth century’s sustained antipathy to the
nineteenth, entirely through buildings that have disappeared. Of the 200 notable examples of Victorian
architecture illustrated in this book, from the magnificent Imperial Institute in Kensington to the vast country
house of Eaton Hall, not one still exists. A photograph is all we have left. As well as architectural causes
célèbres like the Euston Arch and London’s Coal Exchange, Gavin Stamp turns up many lesser-known
Victorian buildings, like the extraordinary Gothic battlements of Columbia Market in East London, or
Chatsworth’s soaring glasshouse streamlined like a spaceship. Surprising, chastening, but also uplifting, Lost
Victorian Britain is a memorable journey back into a world that should never have been lost.
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From reader reviews:

Ellen Jones:

This book untitled Lost Victorian Britain: How the Twentieth Century Destroyed the Nineteenth Century’s
Architectural Masterpieces to be one of several books that best seller in this year, this is because when you
read this guide you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy this book in the book store or you
can order it through online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you quicker to read this
book, because you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to your account to past this
book from your list.

William Chapman:

Often the book Lost Victorian Britain: How the Twentieth Century Destroyed the Nineteenth Century’s
Architectural Masterpieces will bring you to definitely the new experience of reading a new book. The
author style to spell out the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to study, this book very
appropriate to you. The book Lost Victorian Britain: How the Twentieth Century Destroyed the Nineteenth
Century’s Architectural Masterpieces is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book
through the official web site, so you can easier to read the book.

Vicki Head:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will probably filled the space in your house, you may
have it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. This particular Lost Victorian Britain: How the Twentieth
Century Destroyed the Nineteenth Century’s Architectural Masterpieces can give you a lot of buddies
because by you looking at this one book you have thing that they don't and make you more like an interesting
person. This specific book can be one of a step for you to get success. This reserve offer you information that
might be your friend doesn't recognize, by knowing more than some other make you to be great individuals.
So , why hesitate? We need to have Lost Victorian Britain: How the Twentieth Century Destroyed the
Nineteenth Century’s Architectural Masterpieces.

Rigoberto Hamilton:

Publication is one of source of know-how. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but in
addition native or citizen will need book to know the upgrade information of year for you to year. As we
know those guides have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to around
the world. Through the book Lost Victorian Britain: How the Twentieth Century Destroyed the Nineteenth
Century’s Architectural Masterpieces we can consider more advantage. Don't someone to be creative people?
To be creative person must choose to read a book. Merely choose the best book that acceptable with your
aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life at this time book Lost Victorian Britain: How the Twentieth
Century Destroyed the Nineteenth Century’s Architectural Masterpieces. You can more inviting than now.
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