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SPENCER SPEEDWAY LEGENDS 1957-1977 was written using notes and journals kept by the author, and
it tells an in-depth chronology of a racetrack in a suburb of Rochester, New York, over a twenty-year period.
The storyline follows the drivers, owners, promoters, officials, and race crews that made this incredible
history possible. It includes a multitude of behind-the-scenes information and personal stories with rare
photographs from the author and from the racing families themselves. For those who lived through the
period, it is a nostalgic trip back in time. For others, it will be a compelling journey through time where local
tracks were evolving from jalopy tracks to professional racing circuits, and their drivers rose to national
prominence.

About the Author

Len Kasper was born in Rochester, New York, in 1951. Growing up in the suburb of Greece, he enjoyed the
farm life and took an interest in automobiles at a very early age after seeing his first stock car race at Spencer
Speedway at age six. The track and stock car racing, as well as the competition, became a major part of his
life. He attended college at Monroe Community College and Morrisville University, majoring in Business.

Len enjoys fishing, and he is a stamp collector and past president of the Philatelic Society of Lancaster
County. Len and his family still attend several stock car races, as well as Spencer Speedway whenever they
are in the Rochester area. Len's grandson, Lenny, at thirteen years old, has already voiced his intentions of
being a future stock car racing competitor.
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From reader reviews:

Della Ferguson:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. We
all know that that book is very important normally. The book Spencer Speedway Legends 1957-1977 has
been making you to know about other expertise and of course you can take more information. It is very
advantages for you. The book Spencer Speedway Legends 1957-1977 is not only giving you a lot more new
information but also being your friend when you feel bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read
your publication. Try to make relationship while using book Spencer Speedway Legends 1957-1977. You
never experience lose out for everything when you read some books.

Harry Barnes:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the subject Spencer Speedway
Legends 1957-1977 suitable to you? The particular book was written by well known writer in this era. The
actual book untitled Spencer Speedway Legends 1957-1977is the one of several books which everyone read
now. This specific book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this publication you will
enter the new age that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their idea in the simple way, therefore
all of people can easily to understand the core of this e-book. This book will give you a lot of information
about this world now. To help you to see the represented of the world within this book.

Effie Steger:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving Spencer Speedway Legends
1957-1977 that give your satisfaction preference will be satisfied by means of reading this book. Reading
habit all over the world can be said as the opportunity for people to know world better then how they react
towards the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading behavior only for the geeky individual but for
all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all of you who want to start studying as your good
habit, you can pick Spencer Speedway Legends 1957-1977 become your personal starter.

William Marsh:

Is it an individual who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Spencer Speedway Legends 1957-1977 can be
the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your free time
by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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