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A modern Thoreau explores the mysteries of the universe in this deluxe collector's boxed set.

To read Loren Eiseley (1907–1977) is to renew a sense of wonder at the miracles and paradoxes of evolution
and the ever-changing diversity of life. At the height of a distinguished career as a “bone-hunter” and
paleontologist, Eiseley turned from fieldwork and scientific publication to the personal essay in six
remarkable books that are masterpieces of prose style. Weaving together anecdote, philosophical reflection,
and keen observation with the soul and skill of a poet, Eiseley offers a brilliant, companionable introduction
to the sciences, paving the way for writers like Carl Sagan, Stephen Jay Gould, and Neil deGrasse Tyson.
Now for the first time, the Library of America presents his landmark essay collections in a definitive two-
volume set.

Beginning with the surprise million-copy seller The Immense Journey (1957), Eiseley produced an
astonishing succession of books that won acclaim both as science and as art. Here, for the first time in a
single collector’s edition, are all of Eiseley’s beloved, thought-provoking, sometimes darkly lyrical essay
collections, from The Immense Journey to the posthumous The Star Thrower (1978). Eiseley’s subjects
are wide-ranging, curious, and meticulously realized: the role of flowering plants in evolution; a disturbing
insect, seen in childhood; the questions raised by a new fossil; a forgotten episode in the history of science.
Beginning with close observation and vivid detail, Eiseley is fearless and imaginative in pursuit of the
cosmological dimensions of the phenomena he describes.
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From reader reviews:

Archie Williams:

Throughout other case, little individuals like to read book Loren Eiseley: Collected Essays on Evolution,
Nature, the Cosmos 2 Copy Box Set (The Library of America). You can choose the best book if you love
reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a new book Loren Eiseley: Collected Essays on
Evolution, Nature, the Cosmos 2 Copy Box Set (The Library of America). You can add understanding and of
course you can around the world by way of a book. Absolutely right, since from book you can understand
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple point until wonderful
thing you may know that. In this era, we can easily open a book or even searching by internet gadget. It is
called e-book. You may use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's read.

Frank Wimmer:

Now a day those who Living in the era just where everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not need people to be aware of each information they get. How people have
to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Studying a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information specially this Loren Eiseley: Collected Essays on
Evolution, Nature, the Cosmos 2 Copy Box Set (The Library of America) book as this book offers you rich
facts and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred percent guarantees there is no doubt in it as you
know.

Julie Nealy:

The publication untitled Loren Eiseley: Collected Essays on Evolution, Nature, the Cosmos 2 Copy Box Set
(The Library of America) is the guide that recommended to you to learn. You can see the quality of the guide
content that will be shown to anyone. The language that publisher use to explained their way of doing
something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of research when write the book, hence the
information that they share to your account is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Loren
Eiseley: Collected Essays on Evolution, Nature, the Cosmos 2 Copy Box Set (The Library of America) from
the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Pablo Cowart:

Publication is one of source of understanding. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but
in addition native or citizen have to have book to know the upgrade information of year in order to year. As
we know those textbooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to
around the world. By book Loren Eiseley: Collected Essays on Evolution, Nature, the Cosmos 2 Copy Box
Set (The Library of America) we can acquire more advantage. Don't you to definitely be creative people? To
get creative person must like to read a book. Merely choose the best book that ideal with your aim. Don't be
doubt to change your life at this book Loren Eiseley: Collected Essays on Evolution, Nature, the Cosmos 2



Copy Box Set (The Library of America). You can more desirable than now.
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