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The standard approach to regulating working hours rests on gendered assumptions about how paid and
unpaid work ought to be divided. In this book, Ania Zbyszewska takes a feminist, socio-legal approach to
evaluate whether the contemporary European working time regimes can support a more equal sharing of this
work. Focusing on the legal and political developments surrounding the EU's Working Time Directive and
the reforms of Poland's Labour Code, Zbyszewska reveals that both regimes retain this traditional gender
bias, and suggests the reasons for its persistence. She employs a wide range of data sources and uses the
Polish case to assess the EU influence over national policy discourse and regulation, with the broader
transnational policy trends also considered. This book combines legal analysis with social and political
science concepts to highlight law's constitutive role and relational dimensions, and to reflect on the
relationship between discursive politics and legal action.
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From reader reviews:

Colleen Greenwood:

Now a day those who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not need people to be aware of each information they get. How many people to
be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book. Studying a
book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Gendering European
Working Time Regimes: The Working Time Directive and the Case of Poland (Cambridge Studies in
European Law and Policy) book because book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the
information in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Cora Spillane:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only
find e-book that need more time to be learn. Gendering European Working Time Regimes: The Working
Time Directive and the Case of Poland (Cambridge Studies in European Law and Policy) can be your answer
as it can be read by anyone who have those short extra time problems.

Holly Hughes:

You may spend your free time to learn this book this e-book. This Gendering European Working Time
Regimes: The Working Time Directive and the Case of Poland (Cambridge Studies in European Law and
Policy) is simple to bring you can read it in the area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not include
much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you better to read it.
You can save typically the book in your smart phone. Therefore there are a lot of benefits that you will get
when you buy this book.

Jose Brown:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This particular book Gendering European Working Time Regimes:
The Working Time Directive and the Case of Poland (Cambridge Studies in European Law and Policy) was
colourful and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Gendering European Working
Time Regimes: The Working Time Directive and the Case of Poland (Cambridge Studies in European Law
and Policy) has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan
you can read and think you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book are make you bored, any it
offers you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book in your case and try to like reading this.
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